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1 AMENDMENT TO HOUSE BILL 3958

2 AMENDMENT NO. . Amend House Bill 3958 by replacing
3 everything after the enacting clause with the following:

4 "Section 5. The Juvenile Court Act of 1987 is amended by
5 changing Section 5-401.5 as follows:

6 (705 ILCS 405/5-401.5)

7 Sec. 5-401.5. When statements by minor may be used.

8 (a) In this Section, "custodial interrogation" means any
9 interrogation (i) during which a reasonable person in the
10 subject's position would consider himself or herself to be in
11 custody and (ii) during which a question is asked that is
12 reasonably likely to elicit an incriminating response.

13 In this Section, "electronic recording" includes motion
14 picture, audiotape, videotape, or digital recording.

15 In this Section, "place of detention”™ means a building or

16 a police station that is a place of operation for a municipal
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police department or county sheriff department or other law
enforcement agency at which persons are or may be held in
detention in connection with criminal charges against those
persons or allegations that those persons are delinquent
minors.

(a=5) An oral, written, or sign language statement of a
minor, who at the time of the commission of the offense was
under 18 years of age, is presumed to be inadmissible when the
statement is obtained from the minor while the minor 1is
subject to custodial interrogation by a law enforcement
officer, State's Attorney, Jjuvenile officer, or other public
official or employee prior to the officer, State's Attorney,
public official, or employee:

(1) continuously reading ¥eads to the minor, in its
entirety and without stopping for purposes of a response
from the minor or verifying comprehension, the following
statement: "You have the right to remain silent. That
means you do not have to say anything. Anything you do say
can be used against you in court. You have the right to get
help from a lawyer. If you cannot pay for a lawyer, the
court will get you one for free. You can ask for a lawyer
at any time. You have the right to stop this interview at
any time."; and

(2) after reading the statement required by paragraph
(1) of this subsection (a-5), the public official or

employee shall ask the minor the following questions and
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wait for the minor's response to each question:
(A) "Do you want to have a lawyer?"
(B) "Do you want to talk to me?"
(b) An oral, written, or sign language statement of a
minor who, at the time of the commission of the offense was
under the age of 18 years, made as a result of a custodial

interrogation conducted at a police station or other place of

detention en—eor—after—the—effective date—of—this—amendatory
Aet—ef—+the—90th—GCeneral—Assembty shall be presumed to be

inadmissible as evidence against the minor in any criminal
proceeding or Jjuvenile court proceeding, for an act that if

committed by an adult would be a misdemeaneor—-offense—under

Aritete—T1—eof the Crimirnatl—Code—of 2012 —-or—ny felony offense
unless:
(1) an electronic recording is made of the custodial
interrogation; and
(2) the recording is substantially accurate and not
intentionally altered.

(b-5) (Blank).

(b-10) (Blank) . F—during—the—ecougrse—of—an—ectectroniecally
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(c) Every electronic recording made under this Section

must be preserved until such time as the minor's adjudication
for any offense relating to the statement is final and all
direct and habeas corpus appeals are exhausted, or the
prosecution of such offenses is barred by law.

(d) If the court finds, by a preponderance of the
evidence, that the minor was subjected to a custodial
interrogation in violation of this Section, then any
statements made by the minor during or following that
non-recorded custodial interrogation, even 1f otherwise 1in
compliance with this Section, are presumed to be inadmissible
in any criminal proceeding or Jjuvenile court proceeding
against the minor except for the purposes of impeachment.

(e) Nothing in this Section precludes the admission (i) of
a statement made by the minor in open court in any criminal
proceeding or juvenile court proceeding, before a grand jury,

or at a preliminary hearing, (ii) of a statement made during a
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custodial interrogation that was not recorded as required by
this Section because electronic recording was not feasible,
(iii) of a voluntary statement, whether or not the result of a
custodial interrogation, that has a bearing on the credibility
of the accused as a witness, (iv) of a spontaneous statement
that is not made in response to a question, (v) of a statement
made after questioning that is routinely asked during the
processing of the arrest of the suspect, (vi) of a statement
made during a custodial interrogation Dby a suspect who
requests, prior to making the statement, to respond to the
interrogator's questions only if an electronic recording is
not made of the statement, provided that an electronic
recording is made of the statement of agreeing to respond to
the interrogator's question, only if a recording is not made
of the statement, (vii) of a statement made during a custodial
interrogation that is conducted out-of-state, (viii) of a
statement given in violation of subsection (b) at a time when
the interrogators are wunaware that a death has in fact
occurred, (ix) (blank), or (x) of any other statement that may
be admissible under law. The State shall bear the burden of
proving, by a preponderance of the evidence, that one of the
exceptions described in this subsection (e) 1is applicable.
Nothing in this Section precludes the admission of a
statement, otherwise inadmissible under this Section, that is
used only for impeachment and not as substantive evidence.

(f) The presumption of inadmissibility of a statement made
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by a suspect at a custodial interrogation at a police station
or other place of detention may be overcome by a preponderance
of the evidence that the statement was voluntarily given and
is reliable, based on the totality of the circumstances.

(g) Any electronic recording of any statement made by a
minor during a custodial interrogation that is compiled by any
law enforcement agency as required by this Section for the
purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this Section shall
be confidential and exempt from public inspection and copying,
as provided under Section 7 of the Freedom of Information Act,
and the information shall not be transmitted to anyone except
as needed to comply with this Section.

(h) A statement, admission, confession, or incriminating
information made by or obtained from a minor related to the
instant offense, as part of any behavioral health screening,
assessment, evaluation, or treatment, whether or not
court-ordered, shall not be admissible as evidence against the
minor on the issue of guilt only in the instant juvenile court
proceeding. The provisions of this subsection (h) are in
addition to and do not override any existing statutory and
constitutional prohibition on the admission into evidence in
delinquency proceedings of information obtained during
screening, assessment, or treatment.

(1) The changes made to this Section by Public Act 98-61
apply to statements of a minor made on or after January 1, 2014

(the effective date of Public Act 98-61).
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(Source: P.A. 98-61, eff. 1-1-14; 98-547, eff. 1-1-14; 98-756,

eff. 7-16-14; 99-882, eff. 1-1-17.)

Section 10. The Code of Criminal Procedure of 1963 is

amended by changing Section 103-2.1 as follows:

(725 ILCS 5/103-2.1)

Sec. 103-2.1. When statements by accused may be used.

(a) In this Section, "custodial interrogation" means any
interrogation during which (i) a reasonable person in the
subject's position would consider himself or herself to be in
custody and (ii) during which a question is asked that is
reasonably likely to elicit an incriminating response.

In this Section, "place of detention”™ means a building or
a police station that is a place of operation for a municipal
police department or county sheriff department or other law
enforcement agency, not a courthouse, that 1is owned or
operated by a law enforcement agency at which persons are or
may be held in detention in connection with criminal charges
against those persons.

In this Section, "electronic recording" includes motion
picture, audiotape, or videotape, or digital recording.

(a=5) An oral, written, or sign language statement of a
minor, who at the time of the commission of the offense was
under 18 years of age, is presumed to be inadmissible when the

statement 1is obtained from the minor while the minor 1is
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subject to custodial interrogation by a law enforcement
officer, State's Attorney, Jjuvenile officer, or other public
official or employee prior to the officer, State's Attorney,
public official, or employee:

(1) continuously reading ¥eads to the minor, in its
entirety and without stopping for purposes of a response
from the minor or verifying comprehension, the following
statement: "You have the right to remain silent. That
means you do not have to say anything. Anything you do say
can be used against you in court. You have the right to get
help from a lawyer. If you cannot pay for a lawyer, the
court will get you one for free. You can ask for a lawyer
at any time. You have the right to stop this interview at
any time."; and

(2) after reading the statement required by paragraph
(1) of this subsection (a-5), the public official or
employee shall ask the minor the following questions and
wait for the minor's response to each question:

(A) "Do you want to have a lawyer?"

(B) "Do you want to talk to me?"

(a=10) (Blank) . Apr—erat—written; or—Ssiagn—Fanguad




LRB102 17090 JWwD 25704 a

10200HB3958ham001

+ 1

Dt o~

£V

22 Al
&3 W i o g

o

EENDNEPS £ £
|\ s

m

oAl

zoaa 1l Al 1
wooTo O

I

P P
[ W B W e y wy

A CIIc

pu e

Tro < 5 W E W W

Tt o UCIntC o Iror

T

TARVSEIR NI

+ 1

£
T

22 A
TIrcr

z £ o
|\ e

n
ooy

£ 2019

=

TAEVSEI NI

Tro T CIIC S Ep s 1 g o 7 g

O

S S i s i @ e

a3
CooTOoOtTTTo=T

oy o

m

o

ool oo
T COoTCaTTITS

oL

EVNEN
L C C UL UIT LT

o

(1

I TAT L CLIT

L O

[SPny

7

E

\

.
[cTyawd

.

4

E N

n

4

TIIrco T TogTo Cc Uty

or sign language statement of an

written,

An oral,

(b)

10

interrogation

custodial

a

result of

as a

made

accused

11

conducted at a police station or other place of detention

12

shall be presumed to be inadmissible as evidence against the

13

22 Al
&3 W i o g

P A

TTTOTYTITCT

b

criminal proceeding

felon

any

in

accused

14

=N
CIrc

ot o PN
CTTOTT

15

PRSP DNEP
oo T

=
L

= £ 201D
o o U

lal

1
i S i g 1 iy @ e

TAEVSEIENE TR

=1
T

£ 1071 —
A - . A\

A=A
\SAVAw A w

TaENER N NN |
7 e 1 e e

16

b~
veIrr o<

S AW
S E s s s 8 B W

5N + 1 172 -
[CAva== OT CIre

P i
T

R
~J o C LUl

i A A mAY
AN AN A L

L)

o

o 2
o LAaUotT

17

Eede unless

18

an electronic recording is made of the custodial

(1)

19

and

4

interrogation

20

the recording is substantially accurate and not

(2)

21

intentionally altered.

22

(Blank) .

(b-5)

23

24

ERr
TE PO

+
TrC

i st A A
oo CTTTT

o

.

2

ENE S

n oF
TITCCo T T U9 T oUTT

4

P I
A (&9 —cUo CUUuU L UL

coal b
[S L i Sy wy

25

26



LRB102 17090 JWwD 25704 a

_lO_

10200HB3958ham001

n

n
[ETyaws

oo e
ogCc T Toraocc

PN ] 11z
oo calrcrarry

ol ot

o
O

oo A e
To o OoT Oy

n
[Cssawa

TToCT

Tl

£V

1 1=z 1

n

2

i
TITCcoITc ooy ol ool

LS

\w ary

1001

£

EEE=Y

m

i B 1 @ e

=

ClLIT

L

\AW S w

CLIT

L

L e TV L

T

o

T.7

o 3 P
ESEEATAC Lo R ey g

EVSES

n

3 3
cToo TCcoTTaor

PP

£ 25019 £+
J S

A my

o
\wAw S

Qo

O

LT IIC WO

CIIC

Z-O T Zy

S S o s @ e

1001 L
T CIre

£
N

Mmoo

i S i 1 iy @5 e

I =
CTIIC

L

10

P3N
WO

n

2

EVSES

n =3
TITCo T T OgTT T UTT

2

PR, 2
CUo CUU LU L

£+
C1lIT

= £ 201D
o o Ao

EEEN

EEEEY
S S o s s @ e

O

11

12

13

n 12 2 A0
T O s U9 o

+
7 O o CTCTTOIT

P T S S
o U O - C L ULl

Ao m

o

2
T o

14

= £ 2N1 9
\wAw 3 \vgum

EEEZAE BN

Jals
S S N 1) 1) A S A Ay @ R

=1
CTITIC

£ 10217
0T

=
\CAW A Wi v my

EEEZ

EEE
i S s s o o e

O

=1
CIT

15

16

17

rorma ~1 7 1 g
cTcTromTTrtaTrTy

+ 1 oo e o n o
|F ¥ A Wl W v A v i myrw) A\ SR & i 1 S wp

Sag e o
oIty

T £
J_J_,

(Blank) .

(b-10)

18

(&)}
—

20

o
o

PR £
CUITHIIT L O U A il L L

= ooy o
TITro

oo o
oo T ToCTT

P 1oz =
() A W mm m wo v CIIC

ISR W N ]

[ T = Sa e mp g 5

21

ISR NP S I
oo T T TITOIT

EEYSNISDENEV A PR R TR PENEN
T CTCOoOTOCT  orratc=T

o PN T IE BN I = =N
oo CO—To—O

P
O T CCIToT

braowx +1 -~ PN
OTIIcT CIrralr ol

22

23

= oo
LT TTTO (R

o -
& yw) LT -

n

P N 3

n

2

CIIC T IIcC oy TTUIT

ed

AN
(R L O T UL

oot o oo
ot

E

n

=
U TOTIT Uy

=

24

=N
| A W 5

T.T

n
o Emen)

NI Ntz oo
Ty MPL OV Lo TUT

.

o

nd

RSt I SN
ITOTW T CIToS COlITO Iy

.

o

£
UL L IO

E S SNPENES
A\ O o

25

26



10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

26

10200HB3958ham001 -11- LRB102 17090 JWwD 25704 a

(c) Every electronic recording made under this Section
must be preserved until such time as the defendant's
conviction for any offense relating to the statement is final
and all direct and habeas corpus appeals are exhausted, or the
prosecution of such offenses is barred by law.

(d) If the court finds, by a preponderance of the
evidence, that the defendant was subjected to a custodial
interrogation in violation of this Section, then any
statements made by the defendant during or following that
non-recorded custodial interrogation, even 1if otherwise in
compliance with this Section, are presumed to be inadmissible
in any criminal proceeding against the defendant except for
the purposes of impeachment.

(e) Nothing in this Section precludes the admission (i) of
a statement made by the accused in open court at his or her
trial, before a grand jury, or at a preliminary hearing, (ii)
of a statement made during a custodial interrogation that was
not recorded as required by this Section, because electronic
recording was not feasible, (iii) of a voluntary statement,
whether or not the result of a custodial interrogation, that

has a bearing on the credibility of the accused as a witness,
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(iv) of a spontaneous statement that is not made in response to
a question, (v) of a statement made after questioning that is
routinely asked during the processing of the arrest of the
suspect, (vi) of a statement made during a custodial
interrogation by a suspect who requests, prior to making the
statement, to respond to the interrogator's questions only if
an electronic recording is not made of the statement, provided
that an electronic recording is made of the statement of
agreeing to respond to the interrogator's question, only if a
recording is not made of the statement, (vii) of a statement
made during a custodial interrogation that is conducted
out-of-state, (viii) of a statement given 1in violation of

subsection (b) at a time when the interrogators are unaware

that a death has in fact occurred, (ix) (blank) ef—a—statement

N L I SR £ b oot S o A~
i S LU LU L ULL L o U O - C L ULl N \J/ o C &

A~

P N
S ERAZE]

. . L :

P + 1
Ly

143z
T CTv T

V|
T

[OF
B
[OF

“—5), or (x) of any other statement that may be admissible
under law. The State shall bear the burden of proving, by a
preponderance of the evidence, that one of the exceptions
described in this subsection (e) is applicable. Nothing in
this Section precludes the admission of a statement, otherwise
inadmissible under this Section, that 1s wused only for
impeachment and not as substantive evidence.

(f) The presumption of inadmissibility of a statement made
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by a suspect at a custodial interrogation at a police station
or other place of detention may be overcome by a preponderance
of the evidence that the statement was voluntarily given and
is reliable, based on the totality of the circumstances.

(g) Any electronic recording of any statement made by an
accused during a custodial interrogation that is compiled by
any law enforcement agency as required by this Section for the
purposes of fulfilling the requirements of this Section shall
be confidential and exempt from public inspection and copying,
as provided under Section 7 of the Freedom of Information Act,
and the information shall not be transmitted to anyone except
as needed to comply with this Section.

(Source: P.A. 98-547, eff. 1-1-14; 99-882, eff. 1-1-17.)".



